
**Terms of Use** 

 

**Date:** November 8, 2024   

**Version:** 1.0 

 

The CardLinkPro.com website at [https://CardLinkPro.com](https://CardLinkPro.com) is 
owned by CardLinkPro LLC. Some features of the site might be subject to extra terms, 
which are available on the site itself. By logging into the site, you consent to these terms 
and confirm your authority to agree to them. You must be at least 18 years old to access 
the site. If you do not agree with any provision, do not use the site. Note that these terms 
require arbitration for dispute resolution as outlined in Section 10.2. 

 

**Site Access** 

 

Under these terms, the company provides you with a non-transferable, non-exclusive, 
revocable, limited license for personal, non-commercial use. Restrictions include 
prohibitions on selling, renting, altering, or attempting to build a competitive service from 
the site. Intellectual property rights remain with the company. 

 

**User Content** 

 

"User Content" encompasses any data or material you submit. You alone are responsible 
for it. It must not violate the Acceptable Use Policy. The company is not liable for backing 
up this content, and it can be removed without prior notice. A perpetual, royalty-free 
license allows the company to use your content on the site. Ensure that the content does 
not infringe on others' rights or applicable laws. 

 

**Third-Party Links & Ads** 

 

The site may have links to other sites and ads not managed by the company. Such content 
is accessed at your risk, and any third-party terms will apply. 

 

**Disclaimers** 



 

The site is o]ered "as-is", with no guarantees on uninterrupted operation, accuracy, 
security, or fitness for a specific purpose. Liability is limited, with any damages capped at 
$50. 

 

**Arbitration Agreement** 

 

Disputes must be resolved through binding arbitration, with small claims being an 
exception. Arbitration involves a single neutral arbitrator and must be conducted in English. 
Parties may also resort to small claims court or seek equitable relief in emergencies. 

 

**General** 

 

These terms may change, and you will be notified via email or through the site. Continuing 
to use the site signifies acceptance of such changes. For any legal proceedings permitted 
under the arbitration agreement, the courts in Orange County, California, will have 
jurisdiction. 

 

**Contact Information** 

 

- **Address:** CardLinkPro LTD, 51 Bracken Road, Sandyford, Dublin, D18 CV48 

- **Email:** info@CardLinkPro.com 

 

Please ensure you are familiar with our Privacy Policy and Copyright/Trademark 
Information, available on the website. 


